
This course specifically targets high school and 
college level students who wish to strengthen 
their chemistry knowledge with the aim of 
pursuing first-year chemistry. It aims to lay a 
good theoretical and practical foundation for 
first-year chemistry studies. Undergraduates or 
graduates who wish to improve their knowledge 
of chemistry may also enrol, and will benefit 
from the course structure and principles.

The course will focus on the fundamental 
principles of chemistry. The topics covered will 
include the study of atomic structure and 
periodicity, chemical bonding, nomenclature, the 
mole and stoichiometry, equation writing, and 
simple organic compounds. Students will also 
have the opportunity to develop some essential 
laboratory skills.

The course consists of eight days of lectures, 
tutorials and laboratory sessions. It will be held 
from Wednesday 29 January to Friday 7 
February 2025 (excluding the weekend) in the 
Research School of Chemistry (Teaching 
Division), The Australian National University.

Cancellations must be made in writing to the 
Bridging Course Coordinator by Friday 24 
January 2025.

Contact
Associate Professor Mark Ellison
T: 02 6125 4398
E: Mark.ellison@anu.edu.au

For enrolment details please visit 
chemistry.anu.edu./study/bridging-course 
or scan the QR code above
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